


172 September George Wednesday September that a native of Prussia who applies to 
be admitted as a citizen of the United States , cames and proves to the satisfaction of 
the Court that he has resided in the United States at least five years , and in the State 
of Missouri at least one year , immediately preceding this application , during which 
time he has conducted himself as a man of good moral character , attached to the 
principles of the Constitution of the United States , and well disposed to the good order 
and happiness of the same ; and the Court , moreover , being satisfied that said 
applicant has taken the preparatory steps required by the laws of the United States 
concerning the naturalization of Aliens , and he declaring here , in open Court , upon 
oath , that he wll support the CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and that he 
doth absolutely renounce and abjure forever , all allegiance and fidelity to every foreign 
Power , Prince , state and Sovereignty whatsoever , and particularly to the of who he is 
at present a subject ) therefore these of George Schwever is admitted a CITIZEN OF 
THE UNITED STATES Wilson Primm TERM , 1888 . September Anton Stemeyer a 
native of Prussia Wednesday September 5 . who applies to be admitted as a citizen of 
the United States , cames and proves to the satisfaction of the Court that he has 
resided in the United States at least five years , and in the State of Missouri at least one 
year , immediately preceding this application , during which time he has conducted 
himself as a man of good moral character , attached to the principles of the Constitution 
of the United States , and well disposed to the good order and happiness of the same ; 
and the Court , moreover , being satisfied that said applicant has taken the preparatory 
steps required by the laws of the United States concerning the naturalization of Aliens , 
and he declaring here , in upon Court , upon oath , that he will support the 
CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and that he doth absolutely renounce and 
abjure forever , all allegiance and fidelity to every foreign Power , Prince , State , and 
Sovereignty whatsoever , and particularly to the of who is at present a July therefore 
the Anton Themeyer is admitted Wilson Primm Septembe FERM , 1868 . Wednesday 
September Kildrock Warmania native of Prussia who applies to be admitted as a citizen 
of the United States , comes and proves to the satisfaction of the Court that he has 
resided in the United States at least five years , and in the State of Missouri at least one 
year , immediately preceding this application , during which time he has conducted 
himself as a man of good moral character , attached to the principles of the Constitution 
of the United States , and well disposed to the good order and happiness of the same ; 
and the Court , moreover , being satisfied that said applicant has taken the preparatory 
steps required by the laws of the United States concerning the naturalization of Aliens , 
and he declaring here , in open Court , upon oath , that he wll support the 
CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and that he doth absolutely renounce and 
abjure forever , all allegiance and foreign Power , Prince , State and Sovereignty 
whatsoever , and particularly to the thereon the said Diedrich Warmann , is admitted 
Wilson Primm September John C Wednesday September 9th a native of Bavarill 1888 , 
who applies to be admitted as a citizen of the United States , came and proves to the 
satisfaction of the had in the United State least five years , and in the State of Missouri 
at least one year , immediately preceding this application , during which time he has 
conducted himself as a man of good moral character , attached to the principles of the 
Constitution of the United States , and well disposed to the good order and happiness 
of the same ; and the Court , moreover , being satisfied that said applicant has taken 



the preparatory steps required by the laws of the United States concerning the 
naturalization of Aliens , and he declaring here , in open Court , upon oath , that he will 
support the CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and that he doth absolutely 
renounce and abjure forever , all allegiance and fidelity to every foreign Power , Prince , 
State , and Sovereignty whatsoever , and particularly to the therefore the said John 
Hernan of whom he is at present a Subject is admitted a CITIZEN OF THE UNITED 
STATES . Wilson Primm September Will of Barrie Wednesday September 1868 . who 
applies to be admited as a citizen of the United States , and and proves to the satisfact 
of the Court that he has resided in the United State at least five years , and in the State 
of Missouri at least one year , immediately preceding this application , during which 
time he has conducted himself as a man of good moral character , attached to the 
principles of the Constitution of the United States , and well disposed to the good order 
and happiness of the same ; and the Court , moreover , being satisfied that said 
applicant has taken the preparatory steps required by the laws of the United States 
concerning the naturalization of Alliens , and he declaring here , in open Court , upon 
oath , that he will support the CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and that he 
doth absolutely renounce and abjure forever , all allegiance , and fidelity to every 
foreign Power , Prince , State , and Sovereignty whatsoever , and particularly to the 
Ray the said William Kiefaber of whom he is at present a Subject is admitted a 
CITIZEN OF THE UNITED STATES . Wilson Primm September one Term 1895 
Wednesday September 9th 1858 a native of Hannover who applies to be admitted as a 
citizen of the United States , James and proves to the satisfaction of the Court that he 
has resided in the United States at least five years , and in the State of Missouri at least 
one year , immediately preceding this application , during which time he has conducted 
himself as a man of good moral character , attached to the principles of the Constitution 
of the United States , and well disposed to the good order and happiness of the same ; 
and the Court , moreover , being satisfied that said applicant has taken the preparatory 
steps required by the laws of the United States concerning the naturalization of Aliens , 
and he declaring here , in open Court , upon oath , that he will support the 
CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and that he doth absolutely renounce and 
abjure forever , all allegiance and to every foreign Power , Prince , State and 
Sovereignty whatsoever , and therefore the said Henry Bueltis admitted a CITIZEN OF 
THE UNITED STES , Wilson Primin 173 September Conrad empf TERM , 1846 . 
Wednesday September 9th 1868 a native of Hesse Darnslade who applies to be 
admitted as a citizen of the United Plates , comes and proves to the satisfaction of the 
Court that he has resided in the United States at least five years , and in the State of 
Missouri at least one year , immediately preceding this application , during which time 
he has conducted himself as a man of good moral character , attached to the principles 
of the Constitution of the United States , and well disposed to the good order and 
happiness of the same ; and the Court , moreover , being satisfied that said applicant 
has taken the preparatory steps required by the laws of the United States concerning 
the naturalization of Aliens , and he declaring here , in open Court , upon oath , that he 
wll support the CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and that he doth 
absolutely renounce and abjure forever , all Foreign Power , Princes State , and 
Sovereignty whatsoever , and particularly to the Jesse Agustanttherefore the said 
Conrad Kempf of whom he is at present a subel is admitted a CITIZEN OF THE 



UNITED STATES . Wilson Primm 11 John Hanson of follednesday September that itant 
who applies to be admitted as a citizen of the United States , comes and proves to the 
satisfaction of the Court that he has resided in the United States at least five years , 
and in the State of Missouri at least one year , immediately preceding this application , 
during which time he has conducted himself as a man of good moral character , 
attached to the principles of the Constitution of the United States , and well disposed to 
the good order and happiness of the same ; and the Court , moreover , being satisfied 
that said applicant has taken the preparatory steps required by the laws of the United 
States concerning the naturalization of Aliens , and he declaring here , in open Court , 
upon oath , that he wilsupport the CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and 
that he doth absolutely renounce and abjure forever , all allegiance and fidelity to every 
foreign Power Prince , State , and Sovereignty whatsoever , and particularly to the the 
said John Hanson of whom he is at present a subject is admitted a CITIZEN OF THE 
UNITED STATES . I Wilson Primm " ember Term 188 . Rolla Dormiter Wednesday 
September 1808 a native of Camburg who applies to be admitted as a citizen of the 
United States , comes and proves to the satisfaction of the Court that he has resided in 
the United States at least five years , and in the State of Missouri at least one year , 
immediately preceding this application , during which time he has conducted himself as 
a man of good moral character , attached to the principles of the Constitution of the 
United States , and well disposed to the good order and happiness of the same ; and 
the Court , moreover , being satisfied that said applicant has taken the preparatory 
steps required by the laws of the United States concerning the naturalization of Aliens , 
and he declaring here , in open Court , upon oath , that he will support the 
CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and that he doth absolutely renounce and 
abjure forever , all allegiance and fidelity to every foreign Power , Prince , State , and 
Sovereignty whatsoever , and particularly to the therefore the said Rudolph formitzed is 
admitted a CITIZEN OF THE UNITED STATES Wilson Primm Ember TERM 188 . 
Joseph Waborel Wednesday September AD 1868 who applies to be adto a lizer of the 
United States , comes and proves he has resided in the United States at least five 
years , and in the State of Missouri at least one year , immediately preceding this 
application , during which time he has conducted himself as a man of good moral 
character , attached the printentition the United State and well dispose to the good 
order and happiness of the same ; and the Court , moreover , being satisfied that said 
applicant has taken the preparatory steps required by the laws of the United States 
concerning the naturalization of Alliens , and he declaring here , in open Court , upon 
oath , that he will support the CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES , and that he 
doth absolutely renounce and abjure forever , all allegiance and fidelity to every foreign 
Power , Prince , State , and Sovereignty whatsoever , and particularly to the Robert of 
whom he is at present a Subject is admitted a CITIZEN OF THE UNITED STATES . 
Wilson Primin
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